
Introduction

Meningiomas represent 15 % of all brain tumors. They
are the most common extra-axial tumors in the brain.
Meningiomas are more common in women than in men
(2:1) and have their highest incidence in the sixth and se-
venth decades (2).

Cerebral metastases are the most frequent brain tumors
in adults and they may occasionally present as an isolated
meningeal mass, suggesting a meningioma (8). Further-
more, their macroscopic appearance during surgery may
even be taken for a meningioma. Because of the prognostic
relevance in discriminating both tumors, the definitive dia-
gnosis of a meningioma should be established only after the
histopathological report has been analyzed.

Case report

A 43 year old lady with known medical history of bron-
chial asthma and hypertension, presented with anterior
neck swelling for the past 1 year. She was otherwise well
and active. There was no history of dysphagia, hoarseness
of voice, loss of weight or loss of appetite.

Physical examination revealed a painless left solitary
thyroid nodule and a left hemithyroidectomy was perfor-
med. However, the histopathological report showed follicu-
lar thyroid carcinoma. She then underwent completion of
thyroidectomy. At that time, she also had a sternal mass.
A CT thorax was done and showed metastasis to the ma-
nubrium and lungs. She was then referred to Nilai Cancer
Centre for radiotherapy and has completed 10 cycles. In the

thyroid carcinoma treatment, the method of choice also
includes the application of radioiodine. This can help also
in preoperative diagnosis in the case when isotope scan is
made.

She was well until she was admitted again with com-
plaints of persistent headache, blurred vision and weakness
of the left leg. A CT scan was performed and it showed
a 51mm x 46mm hyperdense well defined mass seen arising
from the midline more to the right vertex with surrounding
oedema. Following intravenous contrast administration,
there was strong enhancement pattern noted. There was no
mass effects or midline shift. No intracranial bleed was ob-
served. A diagnosis of cerebral meningioma arising from
the falx cerebri was made. She was started on IV Dexa-
methasone 4mg TDS and was reduced to 2mg BD on day
5. The headaches and blurred vision had resolved and the
power in her left leg was 4+/5. She was able to ambulate
using a walking frame.

Subsequently, the patient was referred to neurosurgical
team, National University of Malaysia Medical Centre
(UKMMC) for further management. A MRI of the brain
showed a well defined lobulated posterior parasagittal le-
sion. The lesion was isointense to grey matter on T1W and
T2W images with central T1 hypointensity and T2 hyperin-
tensity. The lesion was extra-axial in location (as evidence
by the CSF sleeve) and compressed the adjacent brain pa-
renchyma. Homogenous enhancement was noted except for
the central region with evidence of moderate perilesional
oedema. There was evidence of dural tail appearance and
enhancement of the falx cerebri. MRI features suggest le-
sion originating from the meninges at the falx cerebri. The
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diagnosis of meningioma with differential diagnosis of me-
ningeal metastasis was done in view of known primary le-
sion in the thyroid.

The patient was operated on 6/7/05 with intraoperative
findings showed a mixed consistency of yellowish extra-axial
tumor originated from the posterior falx. The tumour cros-
sed the midline but spared the superior and inferior saggi-
tal sinus. The tumour was totally removed macroscopically.
The intra-operative diagnosis was posterior falx meningio-
ma. However, the histopathology revealed metastasis from
follicular thyroid carcinoma.

Discussion

Meningiomas are believed to arise from the arachnoidal
(meningothelial) cells, in particular from those forming the
arachnoid villi. Grossly, the tumour is firm, gray, and sharp-
ly circumscribed, taking the shape of the space in which it
grows; thus, some tumors are flat and plaque-like, others
round and lobulated. Rarely, they arise from arachnoidal
cells within the choroid plexus, forming an intraventricular
meningioma.

The usual sites of meningioma are along the falx (para-
sagittal), dural convexity, sphenoidal ridge, olfactory groove,
suprasellar, and posterior fossa. In 10 % of patients the tu-
mors are multiple, and this may be associated with neuro-
fibromatosis type 2. Histologically, about 85 % are benign.
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Fig. 1: T1W MRI images show a parasaggital lesion that is
isointense to grey matter on T1W images (white arrows)
with central hypointensity (arrowheads).

Fig. 2a: T2W images show a well defined lobulated para-
saggital lesion (white arrows) at the parietal region, origi-
nating from the falx cerebri.

Fig. 2b: The lesion is extraaxial in location as evidence by
the hyperintense CSF sleeve (black arrows).



The typical appearance of meningioma on CT and MRI
is well known. Particularly in the elderly, the imaging ap-
pearance is sometimes considered diagnostic of these be-
nign tumors without histopathological confirmation (3).
Typical appearance of meningiomas in CT findings include
sharply demarcated and well circumscribed lesion with
a broad base, and isodense-hyperdense to gray matter. CT
is effective in showing hyperostosis, bone destruction, and
erosion at the site of dural attachment. On MRI, most me-
ningiomas have no signal intensity difference compared
with cortical gray matter on non-enhanced T1-weighted
images. Meningiomas are iso (50 %) or moderately hyper-
intense (40 %) on T2-weighted images. On both MRI and
CT, meningiomas can exhibit moderate to strong enhance-
ment appearance after the injection of contrast medium.

Direct dural involvement by an underlying intracerebral
metastasis is not uncommon (6). However, true dural me-
tastasis are rare and can be mistaken for meningiomas (4).
It has been reported in autopsy series that up to 17 % of pa-
tients with malignant tumors have intracranial involvement
(7) Only 25 % of these metastasis have some degree of me-
ningeal involvement. Isolated meningeal location is seen
only in 1 % (7).

Although meningiomas have well known clinical and ra-
diological features, there are reports that point out that me-
tastasis from different neoplasms could simulate them. The
most frequently reported primary neoplasms are prostate,
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Fig. 3: FLAIR image shows moderate perilesional oedema
(white arrows).

Fig. 4a: Axial image Fig. 4b: Coronal image of post-gadolinium T1W show evi-
dence falx enhancement with dural tail appearance (white
arrow). The mass is avidly enhancing.



kidney, and breast. Dural metastasis from follicular thyroid
carcinoma is very rare. Radiological features in this case
were those of a meningioma. CT and MRI scan showed
a well defined, lobulated, extra-axial, contrast enhancing le-
sion. The tumor even had the “dural tail” sign. However,
“dural tail” sign, which is usually considered to be patho-
gnomonic of meningioma, has also been described with me-
tastatic tumours (5). Based on the radiological findings,
diagnosis of a cerebral meningioma with differential dia-
gnosis of meningeal metastasis (from MRI) was made.

The macroscopic appearance of dural metastasis is often
indistinguishable from meningioma (8). That also hap-
pened in this case, with intra-operative diagnosis of a po-
sterior falx meningioma. Therefore, the definite diagnosis
must be histology. The possibility of a metastasis was con-
sidered before biopsy in this case because the patient had
a history of thyroid primary, although true dural metastases
is very rare for this carcinoma.

It may be noted that the experience with cytological exa-
mination may not be encouraging in many cases (9). As
conclusion, we opine that the dural metastasis can be often
mistaken for meningiomas. Although rare, extra-axial dural-
based metastasis cannot be reliably differentiated from
meningiomas on CT or MRI (1). In patients with known

systemic cancer, the radiological finding of an intracranial
mass with post contrast enhancement must be considered
as a metastasis until proven otherwise and this holds good
in the present case, also. Our experience in this case has led
us to consider metastasis as a differential diagnosis even
when a meningioma is suspected.
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